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Subject RE: BBB accreditation refund B6/22/2020, 1:24 PM
To 'Finance Department' <accounts@mbec.bbb.org> ¥
™

That's what you said almost two weeks ago yet nothing.
Is there a "BBB" for the BEB.
From: Finance Department <accounts@mbc.bbb.org=
Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 11:58 AM
To: ed@pghs.ca
Subject: Re: BBB accreditation refund
Hi Ed,
I will follow up with my coworker Tonni. Sorry about that.
Thanks,
Sophia
Accounting Administrator
Better Business Bureau Serving Mainland British Columbia
(604) 681-0312 ext. 302
accounts@mbc.bbb.org
bbb.org Start With Trust®
* Trade-mark of the Council of Better Business Bureaus used under License.
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bit.ly/bbbconnect BBB.
On Mon, lun 22, 2020 at 11:13 AM <ed@pghs.ca= wrote:

Good morning Sophia,

ProGas and Heating Services still has not yet received our refund more than two months later.

Regards

Ed Lowe
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